Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

Subject: Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede
Financial

From: Helga Fairhurst <helga@grovecorp.ca>

Date: 2025-07-09, 10:12 a.m.

To: Jeremi Gallant <jeremi.gallant@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

CC: "support@excelsiorsolutions.biz" <support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

Hello Jeremi,

Further to you confirming the conversion from DRS to physical share certificate, please
note that in order to close the private placement financing without further delay
yesterday, July 7, 2025, the broker for our investor Jim Watt agreed to accept a DRS
Advice, instead of a physical share certificate.

Since we were able to close the financing, we want to request a conversion of the attached
DRS for Leede Financial Inc., 400-1075 W. Georgia St. Vancouver, BC V6E 3C9, and
courier the share certificate to the Toronto office of Leede Financial shown below. Please
also send me a copy for our records.

Toronto cage address is 1000-110 Yonge St. Toronto, ON M5C 1T4
Contact: Michelle Scott 416 365-8007

| will advise Danny Harada that the physical share certificate will be delivered next
week. You will be copied on the message.

Best regards,
Helga

Helga Fairhurst
55 North Mining Inc. < FFF
Office: 647-249-7668

401 Bay Street * Suite 2702 « P.O. Box 36 * Toronto, ON « M5H 2Y4
Logo Description automatically generated

From: Helga Fairhurst <helga@grovecorp.ca>

Date: Monday, July 7, 2025 at 1:33PM

To: Jeremi Gallant <jeremi.gallant@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

Cc: support@excelsiorsolutions.biz <support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

Subject: Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede
Financial

Hi Jeremy,

It’s ok. I'll handle the conversion for Leede, and yes, please charge the fee to 55 North.
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Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

Thanks again for your help.
Best regards,
Helga

Helga Fairhurst
Unigold Inc.

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 7, 2025, at 1:26PM, Jeremi Gallant
<jeremi.gallant@excelsiorsolutions.biz> wrote:

Hi Helga,
The issuance has now been completed and sent.

As for the conversion, that will just require the shareholder to send us an email with
the email on file requesting that his shares be converted to a physical certificate.

Can you confirm the conversion will be charged to 55 North?
Sincerely,

Jeremi Gallant

Board Member & General Manager
<EGMUOxJNOISI4RCm .png>

Excelsior Solutions Corporation
600 Annette St., Lower Level, Toronto, Ontario M6S 2C4, Canada
jeremi.gallant@excelsiorsolutions.biz

Propelling Business Forward

Our Subsidiaries:

<xKWr54h7ZNU9edkU .png>

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE
The contents of this e-mail are confidential to the ordinary user of the e-mail address to which it was addressed and is privileged. If you are not
the addressee of this e-mail you may not copy, forward, disclose or otherwise use it or any part of it in any form whatsoever. If you have received

this e-mail in error please advise the sender by e-mail by replying to this message.

AVIS DE CONFIDENTIALITE
Le contenu de ce courriel est confidentiel et privilégié au destinataire régulier de cette adresse électronique. Si vous n'étes pas le destinataire de ce
courriel, il vous est interdit de le copier, faire suivre, divulguer ou autrement I'utiliser en tout ou en partie sous toute forme que se soit. Si vous

avez recu ce courriel par erreur, veuillez en aviser I'expéditeur en répondant au présent message.
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Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

On 2025-07-07 1:37 p.m., Helga Fairhurst wrote:
Hi Jeremy,

We finally received the last subscription agreement for Jim Watt. However,
Leede requires a physical share certificate, and we can’t complete this
today. | recommended issuing a DRS on a pro forma basis for the closing
and providing the physical certificate later this week, and they agreed to
this.

Please issue one DRS for the last subscriber in the treasury direction
and send it directly to Leede Financial at nonbrokered@leede.ca and cc

me.
Leede 400-1075 W. Email to: 1 3,000,000 | DRS Ju
Financial Inc. Georgia St. helga@grovecorp.ca 2(
Vancouver, BC V6E
3C9

Let me know what | need to provide to replace the DRS with a physical
certificate this week.

Please confirm receipt. | will be unavailable until 4:30 pm this afternoon.

Best regards,
Helga

Helga Fairhurst
55 North Mining Inc. - FFF
Office: 647-249-7668

401 Bay Street ¢ Suite 2702 « P.O. Box 36 < Toronto, ON « M5H 2Y4
Logo Description automatically generated

From: Jeremi Gallant <jeremi.gallant@excelsiorsolutions.biz>
Date: Friday, July 4, 2025 at 7:11PM

To: Helga Fairhurst <helga@grovecorp.ca>,
support@excelsiorsolutions.biz <support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>
Cc: Julio <juliofrontstreet@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction

Hi Helga,
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Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

You're welcome!
Please find attached DRS's for this issuance.

If the one subscriber needs to be added afterwards, just send me the
updated TR and | will create another DRS for that issuance.

Have a great weekend!
Sincerely,
Jeremi Gallant

Board Member & General Manager
<ttFSpCrVkm2e937g.png>

Excelsior Solutions Corporation
600 Annette St., Lower Level, Toronto, Ontario M6S 2C4, Canada
jeremi.gallant @excelsiorsolutions.biz

Propelling Business Forward

Our Subsidiaries:
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

The contents of this e-mail are confidential to the ordinary user of the e-mail address to which it was addressed and is

privileged. If you are not the addressee of this e-mail you may not copy, forward, disclose or otherwise use it or any part of it

in any form whatsoever. If you have received this e-mail in error please advise the sender by e-mail by replying to this

message.

AVIS DE CONFIDENTIALITE

Le contenu de ce courriel est confidentiel et privilégié au destinataire régulier de cette adresse électronique. Si vous n'étes pas
le destinataire de ce courriel, il vous est interdit de le copier, faire suivre, divulguer ou autrement I'utiliser en tout ou en partie

sous toute forme que se soit. Si vous avez regu ce courriel par erreur, veuillez en aviser 1'expéditeur en répondant au présent

message.

On 2025-07-04 5:36 p.m., Helga Fairhurst wrote:

Thanks, Jeremy.

From: Jeremi Gallant
<jeremi.gallant@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

Date: Friday, July 4, 2025 at 4:30PM

To: support@excelsiorsolutions.biz
<support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>, Helga Fairhurst
<helga@grovecorp.ca>

Cc: Julio <juliofrontstreet@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction
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Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

Hi Helga,
We confirm this has been received.

Sincerely,
Jeremi Gallant

General Manager

<230FE1EAAA8A42C9A0C186A2FCT85A66.jpeg>

jeremi.gallant@excelsiorsolutions.biz

Our Subsidiaries:

<283881577E1145C5818BF1F023218472 jpeg>
<1602FD48C3C646FF870BF24911ADS8AC jpeg>

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

The contents of this e-mail are confidential to the ordinary user of the e-mail address to which it was
addressed and is privileged. If you are not the addressee of this e-mail you may not copy, forward, disclose
or otherwise use it or any part of it in any form whatsoever. If you have received this e-mail in error please

advise the sender by e-mail by replying to this message.

AVIS DE CONFIDENTIALITE

Le contenu de ce courriel est confidentiel et privilégié au destinataire régulier de cette adresse électronique.
Si vous n'étes pas le destinataire de ce courriel, il vous est interdit de le copier, faire suivre, divulguer ou
autrement 1'utiliser en tout ou en partie sous toute forme que se soit. Si vous avez recu ce courriel par erreur,
veuillez en aviser I'expéditeur en répondant au présent message.

On Jul 4, 2025 at 4:55PM -0300, Helga Fairhurst
<helga@grovecorp.ca>, wrote:

Good afternoon,

The BMO account information has been approved. We
are only waiting for one new subscriber.

Please confirm receipt of this message.

Best regards,
Helga

Helga Fairhurst
55 North Mining Inc. - FFF

2025-07-09, 11:00 a.m.
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Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

Office: 647-249-7668

401 Bay Street < Suite 2702 + P.O. Box

36 * Toronto, ON « M5H 2Y4

Image removed by sender. Logo Description
automatically generated|

From: Helga Fairhurst <helga@grovecorp.ca>
Date: Friday, July 4, 2025 at 2:36PM

To: support@excelsiorsolutions.biz
<support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

Cc: Julio <juliofrontstreet@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North -
Treasury Direction

Good afternoon,

I’ve attached a Treasury Direction for 55 North in
both Word and PDF formats. | may have one more
subscriber joining, which will be confirmed along
with the complete registration details for the BMO
account holder, both of which are highlighted in
yellow.

Apart from that, there shouldn’t be any further

changes to the TD. Please send the DRSs, dated July
4, 2025, on Monday morning at 8:00 a.m.

Please confirm receipt of this message.

Best regards,
Helga

Helga Fairhurst
55 North Mining Inc. - FFF
Office: 647-249-7668

401 Bay Street ¢ Suite 2702 « P.O. Box

36 * Toronto, ON « M5H 2Y4

image removed by sender. Logo Description
automatically generated|

From: Helga Fairhurst <helga@grovecorp.ca>
Date: Friday, July 4, 2025 at 10:41AM

To: support@excelsiorsolutions.biz
<support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

2025-07-09, 11:00 a.m.
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Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

Subject: Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North -
Treasury Direction

Hi Jim and team,

It has been confirmed that we will not receive the
wire from the UK today, Friday. Therefore, we will
need to close on Monday morning.

The treasury direction will be available shortly. For
your information, only DRS statements will be
required.

Best regards,
Helga

Helga Fairhurst
55 North Mining Inc. - FFF
Office: 647-249-7668

401 Bay Street « Suite 2702 < P.O. Box

36 ¢ Toronto, ON « M5H 2Y4

Image removed by sender. Logo Description
automatically generated|

From: Helga Fairhurst <helga@grovecorp.ca>
Date: Thursday, July 3, 2025 at 4:49PM

To: support@excelsiorsolutions.biz
<support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

Subject: Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North -
Treasury Direction

Hi Jim,

| will not be able to provide a treasury direction
today.

Best regards,
Helga

Helga Fairhurst

55 North Mining Inc. - FFF

Office: 647-249-7668

401 Bay Street < Suite 2702 « P.O. Box
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— Attachments:

Re: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North - Treasury Direction - please send DRS to Leede Financial

36 * Toronto, ON « M5H 2Y4
image removed by sender. Logo Description
automatically generated|

From: support@excelsiorsolutions.biz
<support@excelsiorsolutions.biz>

Date: Thursday, July 3, 2025 at 11:43AM
To: Helga Fairhurst <helga@grovecorp.ca>
Subject: RE: [Ticket 95838] - 55 North -
Treasury Direction

We can arrange for a phsyical certificate delivery if
needed.

Jim Adams
Client Solutions/Founder
Excelsior Solutions Corporation

+1-647-417-8173

Powering Business Forward

Leede Financial_Jim Watt.pdf

61.9 KB
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